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Few issues created greater consensus among Civil War-era northerners than the belief that the secessionists
had committed treason. But as William A. Blair shows in this engaging history, the way politicians, soldiers,
and civilians dealt with disloyalty varied widely. Citizens often moved more swiftly than federal agents in
punishing traitors in their midst, forcing the government to rethink legal practices and definitions. In
reconciling the northern contempt for treachery with a demonstrable record of judicial leniency toward the
South, Blair illuminates the other ways that northerners punished perceived traitors, including confiscating
slaves, arresting newspaper editors for expressions of free speech, and limiting voting. Ultimately,
punishment for treason extended well beyond wartime and into the framework of Reconstruction policies,
including the construction of the Fourteenth Amendment.

Establishing how treason was defined not just by the Lincoln administration, Congress, and the courts but
also by the general public, Blair reveals the surprising implications for North and South alike.
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From reader reviews:

Luis Gray:

Inside other case, little people like to read book With Malice toward Some: Treason and Loyalty in the Civil
War Era (Littlefield History of the Civil War Era). You can choose the best book if you appreciate reading a
book. So long as we know about how is important some sort of book With Malice toward Some: Treason and
Loyalty in the Civil War Era (Littlefield History of the Civil War Era). You can add know-how and of course
you can around the world by just a book. Absolutely right, simply because from book you can learn
everything! From your country until finally foreign or abroad you can be known. About simple factor until
wonderful thing you could know that. In this era, you can open a book or searching by internet device. It is
called e-book. You can use it when you feel fed up to go to the library. Let's go through.

Chris Wolf:

As people who live in the actual modest era should be update about what going on or info even knowledge to
make these keep up with the era which is always change and progress. Some of you maybe will update
themselves by reading through books. It is a good choice in your case but the problems coming to an
individual is you don't know what one you should start with. This With Malice toward Some: Treason and
Loyalty in the Civil War Era (Littlefield History of the Civil War Era) is our recommendation to cause you to
keep up with the world. Why, because book serves what you want and need in this era.

Fay Harris:

Reading a publication can be one of a lot of pastime that everyone in the world likes. Do you like reading
book thus. There are a lot of reasons why people fantastic. First reading a e-book will give you a lot of new
info. When you read a publication you will get new information because book is one of a number of ways to
share the information or their idea. Second, studying a book will make anyone more imaginative. When you
reading through a book especially fictional book the author will bring someone to imagine the story how the
personas do it anything. Third, you are able to share your knowledge to others. When you read this With
Malice toward Some: Treason and Loyalty in the Civil War Era (Littlefield History of the Civil War Era),
you are able to tells your family, friends in addition to soon about yours guide. Your knowledge can inspire
average, make them reading a guide.

Kevin Zavala:

Do you have something that you enjoy such as book? The reserve lovers usually prefer to decide on book
like comic, quick story and the biggest one is novel. Now, why not striving With Malice toward Some:
Treason and Loyalty in the Civil War Era (Littlefield History of the Civil War Era) that give your enjoyment
preference will be satisfied through reading this book. Reading habit all over the world can be said as the
opportunity for people to know world much better then how they react toward the world. It can't be stated
constantly that reading routine only for the geeky particular person but for all of you who wants to end up



being success person. So , for every you who want to start examining as your good habit, it is possible to
pick With Malice toward Some: Treason and Loyalty in the Civil War Era (Littlefield History of the Civil
War Era) become your current starter.
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