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The emerging, multi-disciplinary field of systems biology is devoted to the study of the relationships
between various parts of a biological system, and computer modeling plays a vital role in the drive to
understand the processes of life from an holistic viewpoint. Advancements in experimental technologies in
biology and medicine have generated an enormous amount of biological data on the dependencies and
interactions of many different molecular cell processes, fueling the development of numerous computational
methods for exploring this data. The mathematical formalism of Petri net theory is able to encompass many
of these techniques.

This essential text/reference presents a comprehensive overview of cutting-edge research in applications of
Petri nets in systems biology, with contributions from an international selection of experts. Those unfamiliar
with the field are also provided with a general introduction to systems biology, the foundations of
biochemistry, and the basics of Petri net theory. Further chapters address Petri net modeling techniques for
building and analyzing biological models, as well as network prediction approaches, before reviewing the
applications to networks of different biological classification.

Topics and features: investigates the modular, qualitative modeling of regulatory networks using Petri nets,
and examines an Hybrid Functional Petri net simulation case study; contains a glossary of the concepts and
notation used in the book, in addition to exercises at the end of each chapter; covers the topological analysis
of metabolic and regulatory networks, the analysis of models of signaling networks, and the prediction of
network structure; provides a biological case study on the conversion of logical networks into Petri nets;
discusses discrete modeling, stochastic modeling, fuzzy modeling, dynamic pathway modeling, genetic
regulatory network modeling, and quantitative analysis techniques; includes a Foreword by Professor Jens
Reich, Professor of Bioinformatics at Humboldt University and Max Delbrück Center for Molecular
Medicine in Berlin.

This unique guide to the modeling of biochemical systems using Petri net concepts will be of real utility to
researchers and students of computational biology, systems biology, bioinformatics, computer science, and
biochemistry.
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From reader reviews:

Joan Naylor:

Book is to be different for every single grade. Book for children till adult are different content. To be sure
that book is very important for people. The book Modeling in Systems Biology: The Petri Net Approach: 16
(Computational Biology) seemed to be making you to know about other expertise and of course you can take
more information. It is extremely advantages for you. The publication Modeling in Systems Biology: The
Petri Net Approach: 16 (Computational Biology) is not only giving you much more new information but also
for being your friend when you experience bored. You can spend your personal spend time to read your
reserve. Try to make relationship while using book Modeling in Systems Biology: The Petri Net Approach:
16 (Computational Biology). You never sense lose out for everything in the event you read some books.

Cheryl Reese:

A lot of people always spent all their free time to vacation as well as go to the outside with them family
members or their friend. Were you aware? Many a lot of people spent many people free time just watching
TV, as well as playing video games all day long. If you would like try to find a new activity honestly, that is
look different you can read the book. It is really fun in your case. If you enjoy the book you read you can
spent 24 hours a day to reading a reserve. The book Modeling in Systems Biology: The Petri Net Approach:
16 (Computational Biology) it is rather good to read. There are a lot of folks that recommended this book.
These were enjoying reading this book. If you did not have enough space bringing this book you can buy
typically the e-book. You can m0ore very easily to read this book through your smart phone. The price is not
too costly but this book offers high quality.

Steve Henry:

This Modeling in Systems Biology: The Petri Net Approach: 16 (Computational Biology) is great book for
you because the content and that is full of information for you who else always deal with world and also
have to make decision every minute. This book reveal it information accurately using great organize word or
we can claim no rambling sentences inside it. So if you are read the idea hurriedly you can have whole
information in it. Doesn't mean it only provides you with straight forward sentences but difficult core
information with splendid delivering sentences. Having Modeling in Systems Biology: The Petri Net
Approach: 16 (Computational Biology) in your hand like keeping the world in your arm, info in it is not
ridiculous one particular. We can say that no reserve that offer you world in ten or fifteen tiny right but this
reserve already do that. So , this is certainly good reading book. Hey Mr. and Mrs. occupied do you still
doubt which?

Chester Brown:

Don't be worry for anyone who is afraid that this book will filled the space in your house, you may have it in
e-book means, more simple and reachable. This kind of Modeling in Systems Biology: The Petri Net



Approach: 16 (Computational Biology) can give you a lot of pals because by you taking a look at this one
book you have factor that they don't and make an individual more like an interesting person. This kind of
book can be one of one step for you to get success. This guide offer you information that might be your
friend doesn't know, by knowing more than some other make you to be great persons. So , why hesitate? Let
me have Modeling in Systems Biology: The Petri Net Approach: 16 (Computational Biology).
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