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Cutting through the confusing jargon often used to describe single malts, this book, now fully
updated, replaces it with an objective and easily applied guide to taste using a new flavor profile
 
Rigorously researched with the cooperation of the whisky industry, this classification of single malt whiskies
by flavor has been totally revised and updated to include all the newest single malts from the UK and
Ireland. The author has identified 12 dimensions to the aroma and taste of a single malt whisky: body,
sweetness, smoky, medicinal, tobacco, honey, spicy, winey, nutty, malty, fruity, and floral. For this edition,
the author has also updated the taste profiles for each selected malt and reviewed previous entries to ensure
that this book remains the definitive guide to tasting malt whisky. Each entry includes a short description of
the distillery, information for visitors, the author's own tasting notes, and his flavor profiles according to this
innovative classification. The history of whisky-making and production methods are clearly explained,
as is how to organize a whisky tasting.
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From reader reviews:

Mellisa White:

In this 21st century, people become competitive in every single way. By being competitive at this point,
people have do something to make these survives, being in the middle of the crowded place and notice by
surrounding. One thing that sometimes many people have underestimated that for a while is reading. Yes, by
reading a guide your ability to survive enhance then having chance to endure than other is high. For yourself
who want to start reading the book, we give you that Whisky Classified: Choosing Single Malts by Flavour
book as beginning and daily reading book. Why, because this book is usually more than just a book.

Dorothea Profitt:

Now a day individuals who Living in the era just where everything reachable by interact with the internet
and the resources within it can be true or not require people to be aware of each facts they get. How many
people to be smart in acquiring any information nowadays? Of course the solution is reading a book.
Looking at a book can help individuals out of this uncertainty Information particularly this Whisky
Classified: Choosing Single Malts by Flavour book because book offers you rich details and knowledge. Of
course the data in this book hundred per-cent guarantees there is no doubt in it everbody knows.

Claudia Butler:

This Whisky Classified: Choosing Single Malts by Flavour are reliable for you who want to be a successful
person, why. The reason of this Whisky Classified: Choosing Single Malts by Flavour can be one of several
great books you must have will be giving you more than just simple studying food but feed you with
information that possibly will shock your earlier knowledge. This book is handy, you can bring it
everywhere and whenever your conditions in e-book and printed people. Beside that this Whisky Classified:
Choosing Single Malts by Flavour forcing you to have an enormous of experience such as rich vocabulary,
giving you demo of critical thinking that could it useful in your day activity. So , let's have it appreciate
reading.

John Smith:

You can spend your free time to read this book this guide. This Whisky Classified: Choosing Single Malts by
Flavour is simple bringing you can read it in the playground, in the beach, train along with soon. If you did
not possess much space to bring typically the printed book, you can buy the e-book. It is make you quicker to
read it. You can save the actual book in your smart phone. Consequently there are a lot of benefits that you
will get when one buys this book.
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