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A curious ambiguity surrounds errors in professional working contexts: they must be avoided in case they
lead to adverse (and potentially disastrous) results, yet they also hold the key to improving our knowledge
and procedures. In a further irony, it seems that a prerequisite for circumventing errors is our remaining open
to their potential occurrence and learning from them when they do happen. This volume, the first to integrate
interdisciplinary perspectives on learning from errors at work, presents theoretical concepts and empirical
evidence in an attempt to establish under what conditions professionals deal with errors at work
productively?in other words, learn the lessons they contain. By drawing upon and combining cognitive and
action-oriented approaches to human error with theories of adult, professional, and workplace learning this
book provides valuable insights which can be applied by workers and professionals. It includes systematic
theoretical frameworks for explaining learning from errors in daily working life, methodologies and research
instruments that facilitate the measurement of that learning, and empirical studies that investigate relevant
determinants of learning from errors in different professions. Written by an international group of
distinguished researchers from various disciplines, the chapters paint a comprehensive picture of the current
state of the art in research on human fallibility and (learning from) errors at work.
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From reader reviews:

Kenneth Wallace:

The book Human Fallibility: The Ambiguity of Errors for Work and Learning (Professional and Practice-
based Learning) can give more knowledge and also the precise product information about everything you
want. Why must we leave a good thing like a book Human Fallibility: The Ambiguity of Errors for Work
and Learning (Professional and Practice-based Learning)? Some of you have a different opinion about
publication. But one aim this book can give many information for us. It is absolutely suitable. Right now, try
to closer with your book. Knowledge or details that you take for that, you could give for each other; you are
able to share all of these. Book Human Fallibility: The Ambiguity of Errors for Work and Learning
(Professional and Practice-based Learning) has simple shape but you know: it has great and large function
for you. You can seem the enormous world by open up and read a guide. So it is very wonderful.

Bruce Bracey:

People live in this new day time of lifestyle always try to and must have the time or they will get great deal
of stress from both daily life and work. So , once we ask do people have time, we will say absolutely without
a doubt. People is human not just a robot. Then we consult again, what kind of activity have you got when
the spare time coming to anyone of course your answer will unlimited right. Then do you try this one,
reading textbooks. It can be your alternative inside spending your spare time, often the book you have read is
definitely Human Fallibility: The Ambiguity of Errors for Work and Learning (Professional and Practice-
based Learning).

Mary Rohe:

This Human Fallibility: The Ambiguity of Errors for Work and Learning (Professional and Practice-based
Learning) is great book for you because the content that is full of information for you who have always deal
with world and still have to make decision every minute. This kind of book reveal it information accurately
using great coordinate word or we can claim no rambling sentences included. So if you are read the idea
hurriedly you can have whole details in it. Doesn't mean it only provides you with straight forward sentences
but challenging core information with lovely delivering sentences. Having Human Fallibility: The Ambiguity
of Errors for Work and Learning (Professional and Practice-based Learning) in your hand like keeping the
world in your arm, information in it is not ridiculous just one. We can say that no reserve that offer you
world throughout ten or fifteen second right but this e-book already do that. So , this is certainly good
reading book. Hi Mr. and Mrs. occupied do you still doubt that will?

Mary Perry:

Within this era which is the greater man or who has ability in doing something more are more important than
other. Do you want to become among it? It is just simple approach to have that. What you are related is just
spending your time not much but quite enough to possess a look at some books. One of many books in the



top record in your reading list is definitely Human Fallibility: The Ambiguity of Errors for Work and
Learning (Professional and Practice-based Learning). This book that is certainly qualified as The Hungry
Mountains can get you closer in getting precious person. By looking way up and review this publication you
can get many advantages.
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