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Does your relationship with God feel stagnant? Have you stopped growing spiritually? Do you believe
heaven actually exists or that God still speaks to people?

In the year 2000, the Lord came to Anne Odion in a dream and showed her a vision of heaven that took her
breath away…and left her confused. She eventually realized God had a message for believers and had chosen
her to share it: heaven is real—wonderfully, gloriously real!

But being in heaven is about more than simply believing in Jesus; to truly experience that future joy, you
must store up your divine treasures by investing in God’s kingdom today and throughout your life.

Grounded in scripture and infused with fresh spiritual insights, Treasures in Heaven empowers you to live
faithfully on Earth by helping you identify how to use your strengths and gifts to glorify God—enriching
your future heavenly home as you renovate your relationship with the endlessly imaginative and ever-loving
creator.
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From reader reviews:

Nancy Wiersma:

Here thing why this specific Treasures in Heaven are different and trustworthy to be yours. First of all
looking at a book is good however it depends in the content from it which is the content is as yummy as food
or not. Treasures in Heaven giving you information deeper including different ways, you can find any
publication out there but there is no book that similar with Treasures in Heaven. It gives you thrill looking at
journey, its open up your own personal eyes about the thing this happened in the world which is might be can
be happened around you. It is possible to bring everywhere like in playground, café, or even in your means
home by train. When you are having difficulties in bringing the paper book maybe the form of Treasures in
Heaven in e-book can be your choice.

Lea Wheeler:

Playing with family in a park, coming to see the ocean world or hanging out with pals is thing that usually
you might have done when you have spare time, in that case why you don't try factor that really opposite
from that. Just one activity that make you not experience tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster
you have been ride on and with addition associated with. Even you love Treasures in Heaven, it is possible to
enjoy both. It is excellent combination right, you still wish to miss it? What kind of hang-out type is it? Oh
seriously its mind hangout fellas. What? Still don't buy it, oh come on its named reading friends.

Irvin Ehlers:

Does one one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt if you are in the book store? Try to pick
one book that you just dont know the inside because don't evaluate book by its cover may doesn't work is
difficult job because you are afraid that the inside maybe not since fantastic as in the outside seem likes.
Maybe you answer can be Treasures in Heaven why because the wonderful cover that make you consider
with regards to the content will not disappoint you actually. The inside or content will be fantastic as the
outside or maybe cover. Your reading sixth sense will directly make suggestions to pick up this book.

Bethany Zuniga:

That book can make you to feel relax. This specific book Treasures in Heaven was colorful and of course has
pictures around. As we know that book Treasures in Heaven has many kinds or type. Start from kids until
youngsters. For example Naruto or Investigation company Conan you can read and think you are the
character on there. Therefore not at all of book are usually make you bored, any it offers you feel happy, fun
and rest. Try to choose the best book to suit your needs and try to like reading that.
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