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“ONE OF THE MOST INTENSE SUSPENSE WRITERS AROUND.” —CHICAGO TRIBUNE

#1 New York Times bestselling author Tami Hoag delivers a double shot of suspense in these two adrenaline-
charged classic thrillers offered together in one powerful volume.

NIGHT SINS

A peaceful Minnesota town is about to face its worst nightmare. A young boy disappears and the only clue is
a note—taunting and casually cruel. Has a cold-blooded kidnapper struck? Or is this the reawakening of a
long-quiet serial killer? For a tough-minded investigator, it’s her first make-or-break case. For a local cop,
it’s the fear that big-city evil has come to stalk his small-town home. Together they’ll hunt a madman who
knows no bounds and for whom no sin is forbidden.

“Nerve-shattering, explosive entertainment, and should not be missed by anyone who reads for the thrill of
it.” —Michael Palmer

GUILTY AS SIN

A psychopath has been playing a twisted game with a terrified Minnesota town. Now a respected member of
the community stands accused of a chilling act of evil. But when a second boy vanishes, a frightened public
demands to know if the police have caught the wrong man. Is the nightmare continuing…or just beginning?
Prosecutor Ellen North believes she has the right man—but that he has an accomplice in the shadows. Ellen
suddenly finds herself swept into a cruel contest of wits, a dark game of life and death… with an evil mind as
guilty as sin.

“A chilling study of evil that holds the reader until the shocking surprise ending.” —Phillip Margolin

From the Trade Paperback edition.
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From reader reviews:

Marie Brenneman:

What do you consider book? It is just for students as they are still students or the idea for all people in the
world, the particular best subject for that? Merely you can be answered for that query above. Every person
has several personality and hobby for every other. Don't to be pushed someone or something that they don't
need do that. You must know how great and important the book Night Sins/Guilty as Sin. All type of book is
it possible to see on many sources. You can look for the internet solutions or other social media.

Gayle Meek:

As people who live in often the modest era should be revise about what going on or info even knowledge to
make these people keep up with the era which can be always change and move forward. Some of you maybe
may update themselves by studying books. It is a good choice for you but the problems coming to a person is
you don't know what one you should start with. This Night Sins/Guilty as Sin is our recommendation so you
keep up with the world. Why, as this book serves what you want and need in this era.

James Batts:

Precisely why? Because this Night Sins/Guilty as Sin is an unordinary book that the inside of the reserve
waiting for you to snap this but latter it will distress you with the secret that inside. Reading this book
alongside it was fantastic author who write the book in such amazing way makes the content on the inside
easier to understand, entertaining means but still convey the meaning completely. So , it is good for you for
not hesitating having this any longer or you going to regret it. This amazing book will give you a lot of
advantages than the other book get such as help improving your talent and your critical thinking way. So ,
still want to delay having that book? If I were you I will go to the publication store hurriedly.

Brenda Burrows:

Beside this kind of Night Sins/Guilty as Sin in your phone, it could possibly give you a way to get closer to
the new knowledge or details. The information and the knowledge you will got here is fresh from your oven
so don't be worry if you feel like an previous people live in narrow community. It is good thing to have Night
Sins/Guilty as Sin because this book offers to you readable information. Do you oftentimes have book but
you do not get what it's facts concerning. Oh come on, that won't happen if you have this in your hand. The
Enjoyable agreement here cannot be questionable, just like treasuring beautiful island. So do you still want to
miss the item? Find this book and also read it from at this point!
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