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In this second book in a series that Kirkus Reviews calls a “fast-paced combination of middle school realism
and fairy-tale fantasy,” it’s up to Rory to save the Ever After School—and deal with her father’s fiancée.

After taking part in a successful real-life fairy tale, Rory Landon is now an Ever After School veteran. She
has better friends than she’s ever had, and she’s stronger, more confident, and ready to take on whatever
comes next.

Or so she thought. When a nefarious plan from The Snow Queen threatens the entire Ever After School
program, it is up to Rory and Chase to save everyone. Between this new adventure and what is happening at
home—where a potential stepmom has entered the picture—Rory wonders if she really has what it takes to
come to the rescue.
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From reader reviews:

Steven Williams:

Have you spare time for a day? What do you do when you have more or little spare time? Yes, you can
choose the suitable activity intended for spend your time. Any person spent their particular spare time to take
a move, shopping, or went to typically the Mall. How about open or maybe read a book entitled Of Witches
and Wind (The Ever Afters)? Maybe it is to be best activity for you. You realize beside you can spend your
time along with your favorite's book, you can cleverer than before. Do you agree with their opinion or you
have additional opinion?

Kim McLoughlin:

Of Witches and Wind (The Ever Afters) can be one of your nice books that are good idea. Many of us
recommend that straight away because this publication has good vocabulary that will increase your
knowledge in language, easy to understand, bit entertaining however delivering the information. The copy
writer giving his/her effort to get every word into satisfaction arrangement in writing Of Witches and Wind
(The Ever Afters) however doesn't forget the main position, giving the reader the hottest and also based
confirm resource info that maybe you can be one among it. This great information may drawn you into brand
new stage of crucial thinking.

Alta Favors:

In this time globalization it is important to someone to get information. The information will make
professionals understand the condition of the world. The condition of the world makes the information much
easier to share. You can find a lot of personal references to get information example: internet, paper, book,
and soon. You can see that now, a lot of publisher that will print many kinds of book. The actual book that
recommended to you personally is Of Witches and Wind (The Ever Afters) this e-book consist a lot of the
information on the condition of this world now. This book was represented how does the world has grown
up. The terminology styles that writer value to explain it is easy to understand. Often the writer made some
analysis when he makes this book. This is why this book appropriate all of you.

Regina Nichols:

Is it anyone who having spare time and then spend it whole day through watching television programs or just
lying down on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This Of Witches and Wind (The Ever Afters)
can be the respond to, oh how comes? The new book you know. You are consequently out of date, spending
your spare time by reading in this completely new era is common not a geek activity. So what these
textbooks have than the others?
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