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The flames of Donovan Nash’s worst nightmare are fanned to life when Stephanie VanGelder, one of those
closest to him, is kidnapped in the volcanic powder keg of a lawless Guatemala. With help from his inner
circle that includes his estranged wife, Dr. Lauren McKenna, Donovan races headlong into the world of
corruption and deception. Battling the kidnappers, as well as the deadly gas and lava from the impending
eruption of a volcano, Donovan only has one chance to save Stephanie.

Amid earthquakes, volcanic ash, and lava from the eruption, the rescue goes horribly wrong, and Donovan is
forced to find a way for everyone, including a mysterious woman who holds the secrets to his past, to escape
one of the most powerful forces on earth. Aftershock is the story of Donovan Nash, a man battling his
torturous past, while struggling to survive the volcano along with those who matter most to him. In the face
of impending death, Donovan must garner the courage to endure a shocking revelation he’s sought for
decades?a truth that will change him forever. 

(Philip Donlay)
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From reader reviews:

Lawrence Weatherby:

This Aftershock: A Donovan Nash Novel book is simply not ordinary book, you have after that it the world
is in your hands. The benefit you receive by reading this book is definitely information inside this
publication incredible fresh, you will get facts which is getting deeper a person read a lot of information you
will get. This kind of Aftershock: A Donovan Nash Novel without we understand teach the one who
examining it become critical in pondering and analyzing. Don't end up being worry Aftershock: A Donovan
Nash Novel can bring when you are and not make your case space or bookshelves' turn into full because you
can have it within your lovely laptop even cell phone. This Aftershock: A Donovan Nash Novel having very
good arrangement in word and also layout, so you will not experience uninterested in reading.

Norman Duque:

This book untitled Aftershock: A Donovan Nash Novel to be one of several books that will best seller in this
year, that is because when you read this publication you can get a lot of benefit upon it. You will easily to
buy this specific book in the book store or you can order it by means of online. The publisher with this book
sells the e-book too. It makes you quickly to read this book, as you can read this book in your Smartphone.
So there is no reason to you personally to past this guide from your list.

Robert Price:

Don't be worry in case you are afraid that this book will filled the space in your house, you can have it in e-
book method, more simple and reachable. This particular Aftershock: A Donovan Nash Novel can give you a
lot of friends because by you looking at this one book you have thing that they don't and make a person more
like an interesting person. This book can be one of a step for you to get success. This guide offer you
information that perhaps your friend doesn't realize, by knowing more than some other make you to be great
persons. So , why hesitate? Let's have Aftershock: A Donovan Nash Novel.

Joseph Robison:

Do you like reading a publication? Confuse to looking for your selected book? Or your book has been rare?
Why so many concern for the book? But just about any people feel that they enjoy with regard to reading.
Some people likes studying, not only science book and also novel and Aftershock: A Donovan Nash Novel
or others sources were given know-how for you. After you know how the good a book, you feel wish to read
more and more. Science e-book was created for teacher as well as students especially. Those books are
helping them to bring their knowledge. In other case, beside science book, any other book likes Aftershock:
A Donovan Nash Novel to make your spare time considerably more colorful. Many types of book like this
one.
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