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As Americans enter the new century, their interest in the past has never been greater. In record numbers they
visit museums and historic sites, attend commemorative ceremonies and festivals, watch historically based
films, and reconstruct family genealogies. The question is, Why? What are Americans looking for when they
engage with the past? And how is it different from what scholars call "history"? In this book, David
Glassberg surveys the shifting boundaries between the personal, public, and professional uses of the past and
explores their place in the broader cultural landscape. Each chapter investigates a specific encounter between
Americans and their history: the building of a pacifist war memorial in a rural Massachusetts town; the
politics behind the creation of a new historical festival in San Francisco; the letters Ken Burns received in
response to his film series on the Civil War; the differing perceptions among black and white residents as to
what makes an urban neighborhood historic; and the efforts to identify certain places in California as worthy
of commemoration. Along the way, Glassberg reflects not only on how Americans understand and use the
past, but on the role of professional historians in that enterprise. Combining the latest research on American
memory with insights gained from Glassberg's more than twenty years of personal experience in a variety of
public history projects, Sense of History offers stimulating reading for all who care about the future of
history in America.
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From reader reviews:

Lester Jaworski:

Book is actually written, printed, or highlighted for everything. You can understand everything you want by
a e-book. Book has a different type. To be sure that book is important factor to bring us around the world.
Next to that you can your reading proficiency was fluently. A book Sense of History: The Place of the Past in
American Life will make you to always be smarter. You can feel much more confidence if you can know
about every thing. But some of you think that will open or reading any book make you bored. It is not make
you fun. Why they could be thought like that? Have you in search of best book or suited book with you?

Peter Wilson:

Spent a free a chance to be fun activity to complete! A lot of people spent their free time with their family, or
all their friends. Usually they doing activity like watching television, likely to beach, or picnic within the
park. They actually doing ditto every week. Do you feel it? Do you want to something different to fill your
current free time/ holiday? Could possibly be reading a book can be option to fill your totally free time/
holiday. The first thing that you'll ask may be what kinds of guide that you should read. If you want to try out
look for book, may be the reserve untitled Sense of History: The Place of the Past in American Life can be
fine book to read. May be it is usually best activity to you.

Mary Gilbert:

The book Sense of History: The Place of the Past in American Life has a lot info on it. So when you make
sure to read this book you can get a lot of gain. The book was published by the very famous author. The
writer makes some research just before write this book. That book very easy to read you may get the point
easily after reading this book.

Pearl Moore:

Reserve is one of source of know-how. We can add our knowledge from it. Not only for students but native
or citizen will need book to know the update information of year in order to year. As we know those
publications have many advantages. Beside we all add our knowledge, also can bring us to around the world.
By book Sense of History: The Place of the Past in American Life we can acquire more advantage. Don't one
to be creative people? Being creative person must like to read a book. Just choose the best book that ideal
with your aim. Don't possibly be doubt to change your life at this time book Sense of History: The Place of
the Past in American Life. You can more inviting than now.
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