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The practice of institutional bond portfolio management has changed markedly since the late 1980s in
response to new financial instruments, investment methodologies, and improved analytics. Investors are
looking for a more disciplined, quantitative approach to asset management. Here, five top authorities from a
leading Wall Street firm provide practical solutions and feasible methodologies based on investor inquiries.
While taking a quantitative approach, they avoid complex mathematical derivations, making the book
accessible to a wide audience, including portfolio managers, plan sponsors, research analysts, risk managers,
academics, students, and anyone interested in bond portfolio management.

The book covers a range of subjects of concern to fixed-income portfolio managers--investment style,
benchmark replication and customization, managing credit and mortgage portfolios, managing central bank
reserves, risk optimization, and performance attribution. The first part contains empirical studies of security
selection versus asset allocation, index replication with derivatives and bonds, optimal portfolio
diversification, and long-horizon performance of assets. The second part covers portfolio management tools
for risk budgeting, bottom-up risk modeling, performance attribution, innovative measures of risk
sensitivities, and hedging risk exposures.

A first-of-its-kind publication from a team of practitioners at the front lines of financial thinking, this book
presents a winning combination of mathematical models, intuitive examples, and clear language.
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From reader reviews:

Terri Hatfield:

Reading can called imagination hangout, why? Because when you find yourself reading a book mainly book
entitled Quantitative Management of Bond Portfolios (Advances in Financial Engineering) the mind will
drift away trough every dimension, wandering in every aspect that maybe unfamiliar for but surely will end
up your mind friends. Imaging each word written in a book then become one web form conclusion and
explanation that will maybe you never get ahead of. The Quantitative Management of Bond Portfolios
(Advances in Financial Engineering) giving you another experience more than blown away the mind but also
giving you useful info for your better life in this particular era. So now let us show you the relaxing pattern at
this point is your body and mind will be pleased when you are finished studying it, like winning a sport. Do
you want to try this extraordinary shelling out spare time activity?

Martina Joseph:

You could spend your free time to see this book this book. This Quantitative Management of Bond Portfolios
(Advances in Financial Engineering) is simple to deliver you can read it in the area, in the beach, train as
well as soon. If you did not include much space to bring the printed book, you can buy often the e-book. It is
make you much easier to read it. You can save the actual book in your smart phone. Therefore there are a lot
of benefits that you will get when one buys this book.

Sandra Conaway:

Don't be worry for anyone who is afraid that this book will certainly filled the space in your house, you will
get it in e-book method, more simple and reachable. This Quantitative Management of Bond Portfolios
(Advances in Financial Engineering) can give you a lot of good friends because by you looking at this one
book you have matter that they don't and make you actually more like an interesting person. That book can
be one of one step for you to get success. This book offer you information that perhaps your friend doesn't
understand, by knowing more than some other make you to be great men and women. So , why hesitate? We
should have Quantitative Management of Bond Portfolios (Advances in Financial Engineering).

Henry Buford:

What is your hobby? Have you heard that will question when you got students? We believe that that concern
was given by teacher on their students. Many kinds of hobby, All people has different hobby. And also you
know that little person similar to reading or as studying become their hobby. You should know that reading
is very important and book as to be the matter. Book is important thing to provide you knowledge, except
your current teacher or lecturer. You discover good news or update in relation to something by book.
Amount types of books that can you decide to try be your object. One of them is actually Quantitative
Management of Bond Portfolios (Advances in Financial Engineering).
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