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A roller coaster ride of fun and sexy sci fi paranormal romance with a devilish flavor!

Astra Q Phelps is on the side of the good guys in the war between good and evil. Unfortunately for her, the
bad guys have been making inroads on her soul. And when a particularly dark and sexy dark worlder fixes
his heated gaze on Astra, the lighter side of her nature quickly finds itself kicked to the curb by her slut-
monkey side. But Astra doesn’t have time to deal with her love life. She’s in the middle of a war between
two dark factions…a war that just might mean the end of the human population…and it seems the fate of the
world rests uneasily on her shoulders. It’s a lot of pressure to put on one feisty halfling…but Astra Q Phelps
is definitely…erm…certainly…ahh…possibly up to the challenge.

***NOTE: This was previously published under the title 'Tween Heaven and Hell. It is Book 1 of a 6-book
futuristic paranormal romance series of full-length standalone novels with no cliffhangers. The series is
written in first person POV. This book contains some violence, a single, brief portrayal of coerced sex and
the occasional sexual innuendo. The heroine in this fun series isn't always politically correct and may at
times embarrass herself and bumble about slightly out of control. If you're not a fan of self-deprecating
humor, you might want to give this one a pass! #:0) Happy Reading!
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From reader reviews:

Karl Schueller:

Do you have favorite book? When you have, what is your favorite's book? Reserve is very important thing
for us to know everything in the world. Each book has different aim or even goal; it means that reserve has
different type. Some people experience enjoy to spend their time to read a book. These are reading whatever
they take because their hobby is reading a book. Why not the person who don't like looking at a book?
Sometime, particular person feel need book when they found difficult problem or even exercise. Well,
probably you'll have this Bedeviled & Beguiled (Futuristic Paranormal Romance with a Devilish Flavor)
(Bedeviled & Beyond Book 1).

Mack Washburn:

Book is usually written, printed, or highlighted for everything. You can know everything you want by a
reserve. Book has a different type. We all know that that book is important point to bring us around the
world. Alongside that you can your reading ability was fluently. A publication Bedeviled & Beguiled
(Futuristic Paranormal Romance with a Devilish Flavor) (Bedeviled & Beyond Book 1) will make you to
always be smarter. You can feel more confidence if you can know about anything. But some of you think
this open or reading a book make you bored. It is not necessarily make you fun. Why they are often thought
like that? Have you in search of best book or ideal book with you?

Patricia Briggs:

Can you one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt while you are in the book store? Aim to
pick one book that you just dont know the inside because don't ascertain book by its handle may doesn't
work the following is difficult job because you are afraid that the inside maybe not seeing that fantastic as in
the outside look likes. Maybe you answer may be Bedeviled & Beguiled (Futuristic Paranormal Romance
with a Devilish Flavor) (Bedeviled & Beyond Book 1) why because the excellent cover that make you
consider concerning the content will not disappoint a person. The inside or content is usually fantastic as the
outside or cover. Your reading sixth sense will directly assist you to pick up this book.

Dean Herbert:

As we know that book is essential thing to add our knowledge for everything. By a publication we can know
everything we want. A book is a pair of written, printed, illustrated or even blank sheet. Every year seemed
to be exactly added. This reserve Bedeviled & Beguiled (Futuristic Paranormal Romance with a Devilish
Flavor) (Bedeviled & Beyond Book 1) was filled with regards to science. Spend your extra time to add your
knowledge about your scientific research competence. Some people has diverse feel when they reading a
book. If you know how big advantage of a book, you can feel enjoy to read a publication. In the modern era
like at this point, many ways to get book that you just wanted.
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