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“For a real insider’s look at life in modern China, readers should turn to Rachel DeWoskin.”—Sophie
Beach, The Economist

Determined to broaden her cultural horizons and live a “fiery” life, twenty-one-year-old Rachel DeWoskin
hops on a plane to Beijing to work for an American PR firm based in the busy capital. Before she knows it,
she is not just exploring Chinese culture but also creating it as the sexy, aggressive, fearless Jiexi, the starring
femme fatale in a wildly successful Chinese soap opera. Experiencing the cultural clashes in real life while
performing a fictional version onscreen, DeWoskin forms a group of friends with whom she witnesses the
vast changes sweeping through China as the country pursues the new maxim, “to get rich is glorious.” In
only a few years, China’s capital is transformed. With “considerable cultural and linguistic resources” (The
New Yorker), DeWoskin captures Beijing at this pivotal juncture in her “intelligent, funny memoir” (People),
and “readers will feel lucky to have sharp-eyed, yet sisterly, DeWoskin sitting in the driver’s seat”(Elle).
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From reader reviews:

Frank Hegarty:

Book is actually written, printed, or created for everything. You can realize everything you want by a e-book.
Book has a different type. To be sure that book is important factor to bring us around the world. Close to that
you can your reading expertise was fluently. A book Foreign Babes in Beijing: Behind the Scenes of a New
China will make you to end up being smarter. You can feel much more confidence if you can know about
everything. But some of you think that open or reading a book make you bored. It's not make you fun. Why
they can be thought like that? Have you seeking best book or ideal book with you?

Bridget Carter:

Now a day people that Living in the era exactly where everything reachable by connect to the internet and
the resources inside it can be true or not need people to be aware of each details they get. How individuals to
be smart in obtaining any information nowadays? Of course the answer is reading a book. Reading through a
book can help individuals out of this uncertainty Information specifically this Foreign Babes in Beijing:
Behind the Scenes of a New China book because book offers you rich information and knowledge. Of course
the info in this book hundred per cent guarantees there is no doubt in it you probably know this.

Amber Tyson:

Reading a reserve tends to be new life style with this era globalization. With examining you can get a lot of
information which will give you benefit in your life. With book everyone in this world can share their idea.
Ebooks can also inspire a lot of people. Many author can inspire their particular reader with their story or
maybe their experience. Not only situation that share in the textbooks. But also they write about the
information about something that you need illustration. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach
children, there are many kinds of book that exist now. The authors nowadays always try to improve their
ability in writing, they also doing some exploration before they write on their book. One of them is this
Foreign Babes in Beijing: Behind the Scenes of a New China.

Carla Helton:

The reason why? Because this Foreign Babes in Beijing: Behind the Scenes of a New China is an unordinary
book that the inside of the publication waiting for you to snap that but latter it will shock you with the secret
the item inside. Reading this book beside it was fantastic author who also write the book in such amazing
way makes the content within easier to understand, entertaining means but still convey the meaning
thoroughly. So , it is good for you for not hesitating having this any more or you going to regret it. This
phenomenal book will give you a lot of gains than the other book have got such as help improving your
talent and your critical thinking approach. So , still want to hold off having that book? If I have been you I
will go to the book store hurriedly.
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