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An award-winning journalist in the late 80s can't accept the unsolved murder of her parents -- and finds the
sudden appearance of a long-lost cousin odd. Soon she is pursuing his past involvement with her father to
buy an old rundown mansion. Upon her visit there, she is slowly drawn into the strange ghostly haunting in
the mansion -- and attracted to the mysterious man who lives nearby and who may be a murderer. (Recently
edited/updated)

Excerpt:
Chelsea went to look out the attic window, the sky had darkened and it was beginning to rain lightly. As she
watched, the rain became a hard, slanting onslaught that streaked the windowpanes, gusts of wind battering
the rooftop, tossing the willow and cypress limbs recklessly below, thunder booming and lighting crackling.

It looked forbidding, and almost the moment that thought occurred to her, she was stunned by utter silence in
the attic. Even though she could still see it raining, the noise of the storm had ceased, not the least sound of
wind, rain or thunder. Her heart seemed to climb up in her throat, and she felt like she'd been submerged in
quicksand, unable to move from her position.
Then a sound came from the attic doorway behind her; but she could not turn to look in that direction, still
paralyzed by fear. She heard the familiar wailing start, slowly gaining in strength, a melancholy sound that
shattered the quiet, making Chelsea's scalp prickle with terrified anticipation. Gritting her teeth, she pivoted,
stared at the door, now closed...

She'd left the door open, hadn't she?

Suddenly, Chelsea couldn't remember if she'd closed the door, but was almost certain she'd left it open. And
there was no one in the attic with her; she was all alone.

The sound seemed to penetrate the closed door, and in spite of her fear, Chelsea listened attentively. It was
more of a crying whimper now, punctuated by sniffles; and unlike the piteous weeping of the woman she'd
heard, Chelsea knew this was a child's unmistakable high-pitched crying, hiccupping off and on with
exhaustion, gradually ending in a heart-rending sob.

When the voice came, she was not prepared for it: "Mommy, please don't...don't...hurt me...mommy,
mommy...it hurts."

Chelsea felt her throat ache with unshed tears, hearing a small boy's begging plea for mercy. She was rooted
to the spot, still hearing the little boy begging, crying, then hiccupping...his small voice finally, mercifully
fading away.

As though released from a trance, Chelsea ran to the door, violently pushing on it, shoving a shoulder
against the wood, straining against it with all her might...a sickening feeling in the pit of her stomach as she
realized the door was either stuck or locked from the other side.

She ceased her frantic efforts, stood there listening to the ragged sound of her own breathing, nerves taut.
And then came the Chopin waltz drifting into the room, the eerie tinkling of the music box that caused



Chelsea to mumble, "No, oh no, please...no!" backing away from the door to stare at it transfixed as the
tinkling music played on and on. Gasping, she saw a wispy white vapor swirling in front of the door, rising
toward the ceiling, hovering like a vaporous cloud, mystical and mysterious.

Trembling, Chelsea told herself she was imagining it, that her eyes were playing tricks on her...but she could
now see the shape of a voluptuous woman assembling out of the whiteness, lowering to the floor, more like
the vague image on a developing Polaroid film than a real-life person.
A woman's sultry, southern voice spoke: "Leave this place, don't come back."

Chelsea heard herself ask in a trembling voice: "Who are you, what do you want?"

The piteous weeping started and Chelsea saw the ghostly figure clutching its face, blood-red tears falling to
the floor...staining the wood as a puddle of blood formed.

"Please," Chelsea begged, "tell me who you are, how I can help you."
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From reader reviews:

Elizabeth Rodrigues:

The book Season of the Serpent gives you the sense of being enjoy for your spare time. You can use to make
your capable much more increase. Book can to become your best friend when you getting tension or having
big problem with the subject. If you can make reading through a book Season of the Serpent to be your habit,
you can get much more advantages, like add your current capable, increase your knowledge about some or
all subjects. You are able to know everything if you like available and read a book Season of the Serpent.
Kinds of book are a lot of. It means that, science guide or encyclopedia or other folks. So , how do you think
about this reserve?

Gregory Jones:

Exactly why? Because this Season of the Serpent is an unordinary book that the inside of the e-book waiting
for you to snap the idea but latter it will jolt you with the secret that inside. Reading this book adjacent to it
was fantastic author who else write the book in such amazing way makes the content interior easier to
understand, entertaining method but still convey the meaning entirely. So , it is good for you for not
hesitating having this any more or you going to regret it. This book will give you a lot of advantages than the
other book have got such as help improving your ability and your critical thinking method. So , still want to
postpone having that book? If I have been you I will go to the guide store hurriedly.

Bradford Padgett:

Reading can called head hangout, why? Because if you are reading a book particularly book entitled Season
of the Serpent your brain will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in every single aspect that
maybe mysterious for but surely might be your mind friends. Imaging every word written in a reserve then
become one web form conclusion and explanation in which maybe you never get ahead of. The Season of the
Serpent giving you a different experience more than blown away your brain but also giving you useful
information for your better life with this era. So now let us teach you the relaxing pattern at this point is your
body and mind are going to be pleased when you are finished reading through it, like winning a game. Do
you want to try this extraordinary investing spare time activity?

Teresa Obannon:

This Season of the Serpent is great guide for you because the content which is full of information for you
who have always deal with world and get to make decision every minute. This specific book reveal it data
accurately using great organize word or we can state no rambling sentences in it. So if you are read the idea
hurriedly you can have whole info in it. Doesn't mean it only gives you straight forward sentences but tough
core information with beautiful delivering sentences. Having Season of the Serpent in your hand like keeping
the world in your arm, details in it is not ridiculous 1. We can say that no reserve that offer you world inside
ten or fifteen small right but this e-book already do that. So , this can be good reading book. Hi Mr. and Mrs.
occupied do you still doubt that?
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