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Do you want to learn how to close more sales? What about faster and with fewer concessions?

At the critical moment, when we need to take a deal to the next phase, 90% of the time we are not
convincing enough. We struggle to find the right words. We find it difficult to pick on the right data points.
We get our timing wrong.

Don’t worry: you aren’t alone in this. Nobody every showed me how either.

Just imagine what it would be like to sell in a way that was in tune with the buyer. Now imagine again that
you really can sell in a way that makes your buyer truly WANT what you have.

That future is possible: The best sales professionals are in tune with their buyers and deliver the right
information at the right time in the right way.

Devised over 10 years and using in excess of 10,000 hours of research, testing and implementation, the 7
phases of the selling frame detailed in ‘Sell Me This Stylus’ have helped close deals worth over $200
million.

Key learning areas include:

1. The email outreach template that tested 5x better than others
2. How to prospect effectively so that you don’t waste your time and don’t waste your buyer’s time
3. Learn when and how to get the buyer to qualify why THEY would be a good customer

…as well as many tips, tactics and overarching strategies.

This book is for seasoned sales professionals looking to improve their numbers; for start-up founders seeking
to devise a selling framework on which to build their business and sales newbies at the start of the journey.
In short, if you want to sell more; if you want to close deals more quickly; and if you want to sell for more
money, this is the book for you.

Key topics and areas of interest include: b2b sales, how to increase sales, sales process, how to close a sale,
negotiation skills, sales tips, sales training, sales prospecting, sales techniques, sales tactics, sales skills,
enterprise sales, sales presentations, how to sell, negotiation skills and strategies, sales prospecting and more!
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From reader reviews:

Valerie Israel:

What do you concentrate on book? It is just for students because they're still students or the item for all
people in the world, the particular best subject for that? Simply you can be answered for that query above.
Every person has several personality and hobby for each other. Don't to be forced someone or something that
they don't desire do that. You must know how great and also important the book Sell Me This Stylus: How to
think like a buyer, close more sales, in less time and for more money. All type of book is it possible to see on
many resources. You can look for the internet resources or other social media.

Toni Williams:

People live in this new time of lifestyle always try and and must have the time or they will get great deal of
stress from both way of life and work. So , when we ask do people have time, we will say absolutely of
course. People is human not really a robot. Then we consult again, what kind of activity are there when the
spare time coming to you actually of course your answer will unlimited right. Then do you ever try this one,
reading ebooks. It can be your alternative in spending your spare time, often the book you have read is
usually Sell Me This Stylus: How to think like a buyer, close more sales, in less time and for more money.

Maureen Smiley:

This Sell Me This Stylus: How to think like a buyer, close more sales, in less time and for more money is
great publication for you because the content that is certainly full of information for you who always deal
with world and also have to make decision every minute. This particular book reveal it data accurately using
great plan word or we can claim no rambling sentences inside it. So if you are read that hurriedly you can
have whole facts in it. Doesn't mean it only gives you straight forward sentences but tough core information
with beautiful delivering sentences. Having Sell Me This Stylus: How to think like a buyer, close more sales,
in less time and for more money in your hand like finding the world in your arm, details in it is not ridiculous
one particular. We can say that no reserve that offer you world in ten or fifteen second right but this e-book
already do that. So , this is certainly good reading book. Heya Mr. and Mrs. stressful do you still doubt that?

Florence Ross:

Many people spending their moment by playing outside using friends, fun activity along with family or just
watching TV 24 hours a day. You can have new activity to shell out your whole day by looking at a book.
Ugh, do you consider reading a book can definitely hard because you have to use the book everywhere? It all
right you can have the e-book, getting everywhere you want in your Smart phone. Like Sell Me This Stylus:
How to think like a buyer, close more sales, in less time and for more money which is keeping the e-book
version. So , why not try out this book? Let's observe.
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