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The State of the Art in High-Power Laser Technology

Filled with full-color images, High-Power Laser Handbook offers comprehensive details on the latest
advances in high-power laser development and applications. Performance parameters for each major class of
lasers are described. The book covers high-power gas, chemical, and free-electron lasers and then discusses
semiconductor diode lasers, along with the associated technologies of packaging, reliability, and beam
shaping and delivery. Current research and development in solid-state lasers is described as well as scaling
approaches for high CW powers, high pulse energies, and high peak powers. This authoritative work also
addresses the emergence of fiber lasers and concludes by reviewing various methods for beam combining.

Coverage Includes:

Carbon dioxide lasers●

Excimer lasers●

Chemical lasers●

High-power free-electron lasers●

Semiconductor laser diodes●

High-power diode laser arrays●

Introduction to high-power solid-state lasers●

Zig-zag slab lasers●

ThinZag high-power laser development●

Thin disk lasers●

Heat capacity lasers●

Ultrafast solid-state lasers●

Ultrafast lasers in the thin disk geometry●

The National Ignition Facility laser●

Optical fiber lasers●

Pulsed fiber lasers●

High-power ultrafast fiber laser systems●

High-power fiber lasers for industry and defense●

Beam combining●
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From reader reviews:

Emma Patterson:

As people who live in often the modest era should be change about what going on or info even knowledge to
make these keep up with the era and that is always change and move forward. Some of you maybe will
certainly update themselves by reading books. It is a good choice to suit your needs but the problems coming
to a person is you don't know which you should start with. This High Power Laser Handbook is our
recommendation to make you keep up with the world. Why, because this book serves what you want and
need in this era.

Sharon Brogdon:

Hey guys, do you really wants to finds a new book to study? May be the book with the subject High Power
Laser Handbook suitable to you? The actual book was written by well-known writer in this era. Often the
book untitled High Power Laser Handbookis the main of several books this everyone read now. This
particular book was inspired many men and women in the world. When you read this publication you will
enter the new dimension that you ever know prior to. The author explained their plan in the simple way,
consequently all of people can easily to know the core of this book. This book will give you a lot of
information about this world now. So you can see the represented of the world within this book.

Brian Scheele:

High Power Laser Handbook can be one of your beginner books that are good idea. We all recommend that
straight away because this guide has good vocabulary that can increase your knowledge in terminology, easy
to understand, bit entertaining but nevertheless delivering the information. The copy writer giving his/her
effort that will put every word into pleasure arrangement in writing High Power Laser Handbook but doesn't
forget the main level, giving the reader the hottest as well as based confirm resource info that maybe you can
be one of it. This great information could drawn you into completely new stage of crucial contemplating.

Craig Rushing:

As we know that book is vital thing to add our understanding for everything. By a publication we can know
everything we really wish for. A book is a range of written, printed, illustrated or even blank sheet. Every
year ended up being exactly added. This guide High Power Laser Handbook was filled about science. Spend
your time to add your knowledge about your scientific disciplines competence. Some people has various feel
when they reading a book. If you know how big benefit of a book, you can feel enjoy to read a book. In the
modern era like today, many ways to get book that you simply wanted.
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