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"One day, perhaps, this century will be Deleuzian," Michel Foucault once wrote. This book anthologizes 40
texts and interviews written over 20 years by renowned French philosopher Gilles Deleuze, who died in
1995. The early texts, from 1953-1966 (on Rousseau, Kafka, Jarry, etc.), belong to literary criticism and
announce Deleuze's last book, Critique and Clinic (1993). But philosophy clearly predominates in the rest of
the book, with sharp appraisals of the thinkers he always felt indebted to: Spinoza, Bergson. More surprising
is his acknowledgement of Jean-Paul Sartre as his master. "The new themes, a certain new style, a new
aggressive and polemical way of raising questions," he wrote, "come from Sartre." But the figure of
Nietzsche remains by far the most seminal, and the presence throughout of his friends and close
collaborators, Felix Guattari and Michel Foucault. The book stops shortly after the publication of Anti-
Oedipus, and presents a kind of genealogy of Deleuze's thought as well as his attempt to leave philosophy
and connect it to the outside -- but, he cautions, as a philosopher.
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From reader reviews:

Michael Wickham:

The book Desert Islands: and Other Texts, 1953--1974 (Semiotext(e) / Foreign Agents) gives you the sense
of being enjoy for your spare time. You may use to make your capable much more increase. Book can to
become your best friend when you getting tension or having big problem using your subject. If you can make
studying a book Desert Islands: and Other Texts, 1953--1974 (Semiotext(e) / Foreign Agents) for being your
habit, you can get considerably more advantages, like add your capable, increase your knowledge about a
number of or all subjects. You are able to know everything if you like wide open and read a publication
Desert Islands: and Other Texts, 1953--1974 (Semiotext(e) / Foreign Agents). Kinds of book are a lot of. It
means that, science book or encyclopedia or others. So , how do you think about this book?

Peggy Witzel:

Reading a book to be new life style in this calendar year; every people loves to study a book. When you read
a book you can get a lots of benefit. When you read ebooks, you can improve your knowledge, due to the
fact book has a lot of information upon it. The information that you will get depend on what sorts of book
that you have read. If you need to get information about your analysis, you can read education books, but if
you want to entertain yourself you can read a fiction books, these us novel, comics, and soon. The Desert
Islands: and Other Texts, 1953--1974 (Semiotext(e) / Foreign Agents) will give you a new experience in
reading a book.

John Silverstein:

In this era globalization it is important to someone to receive information. The information will make anyone
to understand the condition of the world. The fitness of the world makes the information easier to share. You
can find a lot of sources to get information example: internet, paper, book, and soon. You can observe that
now, a lot of publisher in which print many kinds of book. The particular book that recommended for your
requirements is Desert Islands: and Other Texts, 1953--1974 (Semiotext(e) / Foreign Agents) this book
consist a lot of the information with the condition of this world now. This book was represented so why is
the world has grown up. The terminology styles that writer value to explain it is easy to understand. Often
the writer made some study when he makes this book. Here is why this book acceptable all of you.

Mildred Yen:

Reading a e-book make you to get more knowledge from this. You can take knowledge and information
coming from a book. Book is written or printed or outlined from each source in which filled update of news.
In this modern era like now, many ways to get information are available for a person. From media social
including newspaper, magazines, science publication, encyclopedia, reference book, novel and comic. You
can add your understanding by that book. Isn't it time to spend your spare time to spread out your book? Or
just searching for the Desert Islands: and Other Texts, 1953--1974 (Semiotext(e) / Foreign Agents) when you



required it?
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