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Timothy Brook's award-winning Vermeer's Hat unfolded the early history of globalization, using Vermeer's
paintings to show how objects like beaver hats and porcelain bowls began to circulate around the world.
Now he plumbs the mystery of a single artifact that offers new insights into global connections centuries old.

In 2009, an extraordinary map of China was discovered in Oxford's Bodleian Library?where it had first been
deposited 350 years before, then stowed and forgotten for nearly a century. Neither historians of China nor
cartography experts had ever seen anything like it. It was so odd that experts would have declared it a
fake?yet records confirmed it had been delivered to Oxford in 1659. The "Selden Map," as it is known, was a
puzzle that needing solving.

Brook, a historian of China, set out to explore the riddle. His investigation will lead readers around this
elegant, enigmatic work of art, and from the heart of China, via the Southern Ocean, to the court of King
James II. In the story of Selden's map, he reveals for us the surprising links between an English scholar and
merchants half a world away, and offers novel insights into the power and meaning that a single map can
hold. Brook delivers the same anecdote-rich narrative, intriguing characters, and unexpected historical
connections that made Vermeer's Hat an instant classic.
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From reader reviews:

Kyle Guthrie:

In this 21st millennium, people become competitive in each and every way. By being competitive currently,
people have do something to make these people survives, being in the middle of the particular crowded place
and notice by means of surrounding. One thing that often many people have underestimated the idea for a
while is reading. Yeah, by reading a e-book your ability to survive improve then having chance to remain
than other is high. For yourself who want to start reading any book, we give you this particular Mr. Selden's
Map of China: Decoding the Secrets of a Vanished Cartographer book as starter and daily reading book.
Why, because this book is greater than just a book.

Joann Huertas:

This Mr. Selden's Map of China: Decoding the Secrets of a Vanished Cartographer usually are reliable for
you who want to certainly be a successful person, why. The key reason why of this Mr. Selden's Map of
China: Decoding the Secrets of a Vanished Cartographer can be one of the great books you must have is
actually giving you more than just simple reading through food but feed you with information that possibly
will shock your preceding knowledge. This book will be handy, you can bring it almost everywhere and
whenever your conditions in e-book and printed kinds. Beside that this Mr. Selden's Map of China: Decoding
the Secrets of a Vanished Cartographer giving you an enormous of experience such as rich vocabulary,
giving you demo of critical thinking that we realize it useful in your day task. So , let's have it appreciate
reading.

Leonie Blazek:

Typically the book Mr. Selden's Map of China: Decoding the Secrets of a Vanished Cartographer will bring
that you the new experience of reading a book. The author style to spell out the idea is very unique. When
you try to find new book to see, this book very acceptable to you. The book Mr. Selden's Map of China:
Decoding the Secrets of a Vanished Cartographer is much recommended to you you just read. You can also
get the e-book through the official web site, so you can quicker to read the book.

Alice Scales:

People live in this new morning of lifestyle always make an effort to and must have the free time or they will
get large amount of stress from both lifestyle and work. So , when we ask do people have free time, we will
say absolutely without a doubt. People is human not really a huge robot. Then we consult again, what kind of
activity are there when the spare time coming to a person of course your answer may unlimited right. Then
do you try this one, reading ebooks. It can be your alternative inside spending your spare time, often the
book you have read is actually Mr. Selden's Map of China: Decoding the Secrets of a Vanished
Cartographer.
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