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Among the 151 people who died in the crash of Flight 94 was Mick Hammon, the plane's captain and Erin
Russell's close friend. A pilot herself, Erin now struggles with the shattering losses both of her friend and of
her own confidence in the cockpit.

With pilot error speculated as the cause of the accident, Erin fights to save Mick's reputation for the sake of
the family he left behind. But that fight pits her against Addison Lowe, the crash investigator. Like Erin, he
is determined to get at the truth of the disaster. But his conclusions could ruin Mick's good name and the
future of Mick's family.

Clashing over the details of the disaster, Erin and Addison discover an unexpected, mutual attraction for each
other. But it could go down in flames as the investigation spins out of control. Broken Wings is part of the
Second Chances series by award-winning suspense novelist Terri Blackstock. Combining fast-paced reading
with realistic characters and situations, Second Chances takes readers to where the conflict between good
and evil becomes the proving grounds of faith.
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From reader reviews:

Dorinda Kling:

The book Broken Wings: Second Chances Series can give more knowledge and also the precise product
information about everything you want. Why must we leave a very important thing like a book Broken
Wings: Second Chances Series? Wide variety you have a different opinion about e-book. But one aim which
book can give many info for us. It is absolutely appropriate. Right now, try to closer using your book.
Knowledge or info that you take for that, you can give for each other; you could share all of these. Book
Broken Wings: Second Chances Series has simple shape but the truth is know: it has great and big function
for you. You can search the enormous world by available and read a e-book. So it is very wonderful.

Suzanne Cicero:

Spent a free time and energy to be fun activity to complete! A lot of people spent their spare time with their
family, or all their friends. Usually they undertaking activity like watching television, going to beach, or
picnic from the park. They actually doing same thing every week. Do you feel it? Do you want to something
different to fill your own personal free time/ holiday? Could possibly be reading a book may be option to fill
your cost-free time/ holiday. The first thing that you ask may be what kinds of book that you should read. If
you want to test look for book, may be the guide untitled Broken Wings: Second Chances Series can be good
book to read. May be it can be best activity to you.

Linda Amato:

Reading a book for being new life style in this yr; every people loves to examine a book. When you go
through a book you can get a large amount of benefit. When you read textbooks, you can improve your
knowledge, simply because book has a lot of information into it. The information that you will get depend on
what sorts of book that you have read. If you need to get information about your examine, you can read
education books, but if you want to entertain yourself look for a fiction books, this sort of us novel, comics,
as well as soon. The Broken Wings: Second Chances Series provide you with new experience in examining a
book.

Marion Driskell:

You are able to spend your free time to learn this book this e-book. This Broken Wings: Second Chances
Series is simple bringing you can read it in the park your car, in the beach, train along with soon. If you did
not possess much space to bring the actual printed book, you can buy the particular e-book. It is make you
easier to read it. You can save the actual book in your smart phone. Thus there are a lot of benefits that you
will get when one buys this book.
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