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Distinguished pianist and pedagogue Aiko Onishi sums up her wide-ranging knowledge about the piano and
music-making in "Piansim." "What other source describes the different physical gestures required to produce
so many different kinds of sound?--not just singing tones, but also, for example, harmonious tones, colorless
tones, rich chordal tones, and bell-like tones. "With imaginative metaphors and similes, Ms. Onishi suggests
how to analyze a score for expressive musical communication. She supplies us with practical suggestions for
learning repertoire, memorizing, and preparing for performance. Just her observations about pedaling make
this book indispensable. "In my view, Aiko Onishi's 'Pianism' is a landmark in the literature about playing
the piano. It is an invaluable resource for teachers and for students from the earliest years of study on
through the artist level." Nelita True Professor and Chair, Piano Faculty Eastman School of Music
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From reader reviews:

Mary Flynn:

The event that you get from Pianism could be the more deep you rooting the information that hide inside the
words the more you get interested in reading it. It does not mean that this book is hard to recognise but
Pianism giving you enjoyment feeling of reading. The writer conveys their point in specific way that can be
understood by anyone who read it because the author of this e-book is well-known enough. This kind of
book also makes your vocabulary increase well. It is therefore easy to understand then can go along, both in
printed or e-book style are available. We propose you for having that Pianism instantly.

Helen Chandler:

Often the book Pianism will bring you to definitely the new experience of reading the book. The author style
to describe the idea is very unique. In case you try to find new book to see, this book very suited to you. The
book Pianism is much recommended to you you just read. You can also get the e-book from your official
web site, so you can more easily to read the book.

Sophie Clark:

A lot of people always spent their free time to vacation or maybe go to the outside with them friends and
family or their friend. Were you aware? Many a lot of people spent that they free time just watching TV, or
even playing video games all day long. If you would like try to find a new activity here is look different you
can read the book. It is really fun to suit your needs. If you enjoy the book that you just read you can spent
all day every day to reading a reserve. The book Pianism it doesn't matter what good to read. There are a lot
of those who recommended this book. These folks were enjoying reading this book. If you did not have
enough space to develop this book you can buy typically the e-book. You can m0ore very easily to read this
book through your smart phone. The price is not too costly but this book has high quality.

Magdalena McKinney:

Do you really one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt if you find yourself in the book store?
Make an effort to pick one book that you just dont know the inside because don't ascertain book by its cover
may doesn't work is difficult job because you are afraid that the inside maybe not while fantastic as in the
outside appear likes. Maybe you answer can be Pianism why because the excellent cover that make you
consider about the content will not disappoint an individual. The inside or content is definitely fantastic as
the outside or cover. Your reading 6th sense will directly guide you to pick up this book.
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